Freedom of Information Request
29 March 2023

Question
| would like to know:

I would like the organisation to provide me with the following departmental documents
around ICT and corporate procurement. Many organisations within your region have different
document title names:

1. 2023/24 IT Department Documents; - these types of documents have detailed information
on the department's future plans and strategies. These documents include:ICT
Strategy/Plan, ICT Department Plan, ICT Financial Plan

2. ICT Org Chart;- with names and job titles
3. Corporate Procurement Strategy that covers 2023/24 and more.

For all the documents | have requested, please provide me with the 2023/24 documents, |
only want to only receive documents that are live and valid. If the document is a strategic
plan (e.g., 2020-2025) that covers a set number of years, please provide me with the 2023
version.

| also require the full version of the documents | have requested, if any parts of the
document is missing, please state this in the response

Answer

1. 2023/24 IT Department Documents;- these types of documents have detailed
information on the department's future plans and strategies. These documents
include: ICT Strategy/Plan, ICT Department Plan, ICT Financial Plan

Please find attached the Scottish Ambulance Service Digital and Data Strategy 2022-2030.

We do not hold the following requested documents; ICT Departmental Plan or ICT Financial
Plan for 2023/2024 as yet and are unable to provide an estimated date when we will.
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2. ICT Org Chart ;- with names and job titles

. General Manages ICT 9

Please see the chart below.
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Permanent Post

General Manager, ICT — John Baker
Head of ICT Infrastructure & Security — Robert Kay
Head of ICT Service Delivery — Mark Christie

Head of ICT Development & Training — Andrew Sim

3. Corporate Procurement Strategy that covers 2023/24 and more.

We have searched our records and do not hold the information you have requested.
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