
Working Together for Better Patient Care 
 

 

 

Freedom of Information Request 

22 November 2022 

Question 

I would like to know:  

Please can you tell me how many “critical incidents” have been declared at the 

service in the financial years of:  

i) 2017/18  

ii) 2018/19  

iii) 2019/20  

iv) 2020/21  

v) 2021/22  

vi) 2022 to date.  

 

We sought clarification on the 28th of October 2022 to ask you to define ‘critical 

incidents’, you confirmed it was ‘state of alert for service use’ or ‘major incident’ 

Answer 

We have searched our records and we do not hold data against the definition you 

are requesting, It is for this reason; we have applied the exemption Section 17 of the 

Freedom of Information Scotland Act 2002 as information not held.  

 


